FAIRFIELD TOWNSHIP
RESOLUTION NO. 19-125

RESOLUTION TO APPROVE PURCHASE OF FIRE HOSE FOR THE FIRE DEPARTMENT
FROM ALL AMERICAN FIRE EQUIPMENT, INC., IN THE TOTAL AMOUNT OF $44,026.00.

WHEREAS: The Fire Chief has recommended the purchase of new hose to outfit the department to
enhance the safety and welfare of the residents of Fairfield Township; and

WHEREAS: The selected bid provides the lowest, best bid, for the desired equipment; and

WHEREAS: The Board has determined that the current budget can sustain this purchase in the Public
Safety Fund No. 2191,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of Trustees of Fairfield Township, Butler
County, Ohio, as follows;

SECTION 1: The Board hereby approves the purchase of new Fire Hose from All American Fire
Equipment, Inc., for the Fire Department in the total amount of $44,026.00, attached
hereto as Exhibit “A”.

SECTION 2: The Board hereby dispenses with the requirement that this resolution be read on two
separate days, pursuant to RC 504.10, and authorizes the adoption of this resolution upon
its first reading.

SECTION 3 This resolution is the subject of the general authority granted to the Board of Trustees
through the Ohio Revised Code and not the specific authority granted to the Board of
Trustees through the status as a Limited Home Rule Township.

SECTION 4: That it is hereby found and determined that all formal actions of this Board concerning and
relating to the passage of this Resolution were taken in meetings open to the public, in
compliance with all legal requirements including §121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.

SECTION 5: This resolution shall take effect at the earliest period allowed by law.

Adopted: September 25,2019

Board of Trustees Vote of Trustees

Shannon Hartkemeyeéns.
Joe McAbee: = % et (/"Q” Jv&_
Susan Berding ,%@Q‘Z/f‘/ /&/V[é/"c/g" JtJiL

AUTHENTICATION

This is to certify that this is a resolution which was duly passed, and, filed with the Fairfield Township
Fiscal Officer this & 549 day of N 2019.

Gt

Shelly Schultz, Fafifield Township Fig¢al Officer

;P;IEVED AS TO FORM:
awrence E. Barbiere, Township Law Director




‘“-'-"Amic““ ALL-ARMEICAN FilE ECUIPMENT, iNC NOTE: Thisis a quote NOT an invoice.

5101 US ROUTE 22 SW PO BOX 97 WASHINGTON CH, OH 43160 i i i i
A i e i b You will receive an actual invoice seperate
SIS CUTHWAY STIREET SW, ‘CANTON, GHAsIDE from this form with any applicable frieight
PHONE (330) 479-1383  FAX (330) 4791306 and/or taxes

3253 US ROUTE GO E PO BOX 146 ONA, WV 25545
PHONE (304) 733-3501 FAX (304) 736-9557

ANFEIN.com

FilE EQUIPMENT auare OROER
DATE:

BILLTO:  (Please leave address blank unless special instructions for billing) SHIPTO: 09/23/19 DATE;
FAIRFIELD TWP FAIRFIELD TWP

sM po# TERMS QUOTE ISSUED BY: PHONEW CONTACT
r l | NET 30 ' | | 513-518-5393 JASON JEFFERS

QUANTITY DESCRIPTION usT EACH TOTAL

QUOTED ORDERED BRAND--MODEL--SIZE-COLOR PRICE PRICE PRICE

60 BIG 10 e Double Jacket Fire Hose all Polyester Rubber Lined priced w/ 129.00 7,740.00

Alum. Couplings 13/4"- FDNY DP18-800-FDNY 50' NST - COLOR?

74 TRU-ID e Double Jacket Fire Hose all Polyester Rubber Lined priced w/ 176.00 13,024.00

Aluminum Couplings 2 1/2" DP25-800-TRUID 50" NST - COLOR?

40 PRO-FLOW LDH e Rubber Covered Supply Hose 100' 5"- STORZ CPL 530.00 21,200.00
4 PRO-FLOW LDH « Rubber Covered Supply Hose 50' 5"- STORZ CPL 334.00 1,336.00
3 PRO-FLOW LDH e Rubber Covered Supply Hose 25' 5"~ STORZ CPL 242.00 726.00

PRICE INCREASE FOR KEY HOSE ON 10-1-19

THESE PRICES ARE ONLY VALID UNTIL 8-30-19

Pen Abtpched Emar ( Ghippine, & Stewerling
/)ﬁf (oelvdl @

STATE TAXES AND FREIGHT CHARGES WILL APPLY UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED TYPOGRAPHICAL AND STENOGRAPHIC ERRORS SUBJECT TO CORRECTION

_344.026.00

"Honored to equip those that courageously protect us. "

www.aafe911.com

rosenbauer

Firerrighting Technologiy

AAFE SALESMAN'S SIGNATURE Facebook CUSTOMER ACCEPTANCE SIGNATURE

QUOTE VALID FOR 30 DAYS




Thomas, Timothy

From: Berter, Ryan

Sent; Tuesday, September 24, 2019 8:16 AM

To: Thomas, Timothy

Subject: All American KEY HOSE QUOTE 9-23-19.pdf

Attachments: image001,jpg; ATT00001.htm; FAIRFIELD TWP KEY HOSE QUOTE 9-23-19.pdf:

ATT00002.htm

We have one more coming and it should the fowest,

Ryan Berter
Captain

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Jeffers, Jason" <jjeffers@fairfieldtwp.org>

Date: September 24, 2019 at 07:35:10 EDT

To: "Berter, Ryan" <RBerter@fairfieldtwp.org>

Subject: Fwd: FAIRFIELD TWP KEY HOSE QUOTE 9-23-19.pdf

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Cory Woods <cory.woods@allamericanfire.us>
Date: September 23, 2019 at 17:30:55 EDT

To: "jleffers@fairfieldtwp.org" <jjeffers@fairfieldtwp.org>
Subject: FAIRFIELD TWP KEY HOSE QUOTE 9-23-19.pdf

Attached you will find the quote for Key Hose. Please let me know if you need anything
changed on this quote and | can make it happen. Also please remember that prices will
be going up Oct 1, 2019.

Please advise that you have received this quote,

Thank you!



Thomas, Timothy

From: Jeffers, Jason

Sent: Tuesday, September 24, 2019 10:42 AM

To: Thomas, Timothy

Subject: Fwd: FAIRFIELD TWP KEY HOSE QUOTE 9-23-19.pdf

Sent fram my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Cory Woods <cory.woods@allamericanfire.us>

Date: September 24, 2019 at 10:36:53 EDT

To: "Jeffers, Jason” <jjeffers@fairficldtwp.org>

Subject: Re: FAIRFIELD TWP KEY HOSE QUOTE $-23-19.pdf

Did t get low bid. Lol?

Gel Qutlook for i0S

From: Jeffers, Jason <jjeffers@fairfieldtwp.org>

Sent: Tuesday, September 24, 2019 10:27:38 AM

To: Cory Woods <cory.woods@allamericanfire.us>
Subject: Re: FAIRFIELD TWP KEY HOSE QUOTE 9-23-19.pdf

Awesome. Thank you. We are going for approval at tomorrow’s meeting and I'll be in touch
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 24, 2019, at 09:56, Cory Woods <cory.woods@allamericanfire.us> wrote:

Stenciling is free also. Just not stamping of couplings.
Thank you.

Get Outlook for i0S

From: Jeffers, Jason <jieffers@fairfieldtwp.org>

Sent: Tuesday, September 24, 2019 9:33:09 AM

To: Cory Woads <cory.woods@allamericanfire.us>
Subject: Re: FAIRFIELD TWP KEY HOSE QUOTE 9-23-19.pdf

Sorry for all the questions but does it come stenciled/numbered?
Sent from ry iPhone

On Sep 24, 2019, at 09:21, Cory Woods <cory.woods@allamericanfire.us> wrote;

It will be free.



Thank you.

Get Qutlook for 105

From: Jeffers, Jason <jjeffers@fairfieldtwp.org>

Sent: Tuesday, September 24, 2019 8:50:02 AM

To: Cory Woods <cory.woods@allamericanfire.us>
Subject: Re: FAIRFIELD TWP KEY HOSE QUOTE 9-23-19.pdf

Cory,
Do you have an estimate on shipping charges?

Thanks
Jason
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 23, 2019, at 17:31, Cory Woods
<cory.woods@allamericanfire.us> wrote:

Attached you will find the quote for Key Hose. Please
let me know if you need anything changed on this quote
and | can make it happen. Also please remember that
prices will be going up Oct 1, 2019.

Please advise that you have received this quote.

Thank you!

<image(001.jpg> Cory Woods
Sales Consuitant
All American Fire Equipment
M 740-505-1916 | © 740-333-6801

cory@aafed11.com

<FAIRFIELD TWP KEY HOSE QUOTE 9-23-19.pdf>



Heritage Fire Equipment

2162 Cloverleaf Street East y
Columbus, OH 43232 : _
i FIRE EQUIPMENT
info@heritagefireequipment.com

heritagefireequipment.com

ADDRESS SHIP TO

Fairfield Township Fire Fairfield Township Fire
Department Department

6048 Morris Road 6048 Morris Road
Fairfield, Ohio 45011 Fairfield, Ohio 45011

| ITEMDESGHIPTION. R Lo i L . QY BATE. AMOUNT

RC50-450 (100') 40 568.00 22,720.00
Hose, Key, Pro-Flow LDH, Rubber Covered Supply Hose, 5",

100 _

RC50-450 (50”) 4 252.00 1,008.00
Hose, Key, Pro-Flow LDH, Rubber Covered Supply Hose, 5",

50"

RC50-450 (25") 3 250.00 750.00
Hose, Key, Pro-Flow, 5" 25" Section, Storz Coupling

DP25-800-TRU-50-O-ARN 74 188.00 13,912.00
Hose, Key, TRU-ID, 2.5, 50 .

DP18-800-FDNY-50 60 138.00  8,280.00

Hose, Key, FDNY Spec, 1.75", 50’

Quote is valid for 30 days and includes shipping.

4567000

Accepted By Accepted Date



QUOTE

'V OGELPOHL

/" FIRE EQUIPMENT Gy e

2770 Circleport Dr. Erlanger, Ky 41018 Territory Manager
Office 859-282-1000 Fax 859-282-1550 B00-797-8317 Mobile 859-630-0038

E-Mail garyt@vogelpohifire.com

Fo  Jason Jeffers
Fairfield Twp Fire Dept
6048 Morris Rd
Hamilton OH  45011-5118

| ValidFor || PaymentTerms || Frewnt || Swpvia |
30 days Net 15 Naot Included Best
| Qty] | 'Deétriptidn' T R T T H'”'Ea‘\Ch l|:""EXtehdéd i
60 Key Hose, Big 10, FDNY specifications 1 3/4 inch hase, choice of colors, 50 ft length, NST couplings { $140.00 $8,400.00
3000 feet)
74 Key Hose, Tru-ID 2 1/2 inch fire hose, choice of colors 50 foot sections, NST couplings, (3700 feet) $183.00 $13,542.00
40 Key Hose, 5 inch, Nitrile Rubber, colors, yellow, arange, blue, and red, locking Storz couplings 100 $518.00 $20,720.00
foot sections
4 Key Hose, 5 inch, Nitrite Rubber, colors, yellow, orange, blue, and red, tocking Storz cauplings 50 $343.00 §1,372.00
foot sections .
3 Key Hose, 5 inch, Nitrile Rubber, colors, yeltow, orange, blue, and red, locking Storz couplings 25 $251.00 $753.00

foot sections

Please contact me if | can be of further assistance.

All can be stencilled FTFD

All can be numbered if requested

Colors are available

Price increase Oct 1, 2019, | have these ;locked in for 30 days

Thank you for the opportunity to provide you with this proposal.
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